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DESCRIPTION OF THE TRUST AND THE FUND 
 
     The Blue Chip Investor Fund (the "Fund") was organized as a non-diversified series of Blue Chip Investor Funds (the "Trust"), 
formerly the Premier Funds, on November 1, 2001.  The Trust is an open-end investment company established under the laws of 
Ohio by an Agreement and Declaration of Trust dated November 1, 2001 (the "Trust Agreement").  The Trust Agreement permits 
the Trustees to issue an unlimited number of shares of beneficial interest of separate series without par value.  The Fund is one of a 
series of funds currently authorized by the Trustees.  The investment adviser to the Fund is Check Capital Management Inc. (the 
"Adviser"). 
 
     The Fund does not issue share certificates.  All shares are held in non-certificate form registered on the books of the Fund and 
the Fund's transfer agent for the account of the shareholder.  Each share of a series represents an equal proportionate interest in the 
assets and liabilities belonging to that series with each other share of that series and is entitled to such dividends and distributions 
out of income belonging to the series as are declared by the Trustees. The shares do not have cumulative voting rights or any 
preemptive or conversion rights, and the Trustees have the authority from time to time to divide or combine the shares of any 
series into a greater or lesser number of shares of that series so long as the proportionate beneficial interest in the assets belonging 
to that series and the rights of shares of any other series are in no way affected.  In case of any liquidation of a series, the holders of 
shares of the series being liquidated will be entitled to receive as a class a distribution out of the assets, net of the liabilities, 
belonging to that series.  Expenses attributable to any series are borne by that series. Any general expenses of the Trust not readily 
identifiable as belonging to a particular series are allocated by or under the direction of the Trustees in such manner as the Trustees 
determine to be fair and equitable.  No shareholder is liable to further calls or to assessment by the Trust without his or her express 
consent. 
 
     For information concerning the purchase and redemption of shares of the Fund, see "How to Buy and Sell Shares" in the 
Prospectus.  For a description of the methods used to determine the share price and value of the Fund's assets, see "Pricing of Fund 
Shares" in the Prospectus and "Pricing of Fund Shares" in this SAI. 
 
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION ABOUT FUND INVESTMENTS AND RISK CONSIDERATIONS 
 
     This section contains a discussion of some of the investments the Fund may make and some of the techniques it may use. 
 
     A. Equity Securities.  The Fund may invest in equity securities such as Common stock, convertible preferred stock, convertible 
bonds, rights and warrants. Common stocks, the most familiar type, represent an equity (ownership) interest in a corporation. 
Warrants are options to purchase equity securities at a specified price for a specific time period.  Rights are similar to warrants, but 
normally have a short duration and are distributed by the issuer to its shareholders.  Although equity securities have a history of 
long term growth in value, their prices fluctuate based on changes in a company's financial condition and on overall market and 
economic conditions. 
 
     B. Foreign Securities. There is no limitation to investing in foreign securities.  These investments may be publicly traded in the 
United States or on a foreign exchange and may be bought and sold in a foreign currency.  The Adviser generally selects foreign 
securities on a stock-by-stock.  Foreign investments are subject to risks not usually associated with owning securities of U.S. 
issuers.  These risks can include fluctuations in foreign currencies, foreign currency exchange controls, political and economic 
instability, differences in financial reporting, differences in securities regulation and trading, and taxation issues. 
 
     C. Short Sales.  The Fund may sell a security short in anticipation of a decline in the market value of the security.  When the 
Fund engages in a short sale, it sells a security which it does not own. To complete the transaction, the Fund must borrow the 
security in order to deliver it to the buyer.  The Fund must replace the borrowed security by purchasing it at the market price at the 
time of replacement, which may be more or less than the price at which the Fund sold the security.  The Fund will incur a loss as a 
result of the short sale if the price of the security increases between the date of the short sale and the date on which the Fund 
replaces the borrowed security.  The Fund will realize a profit if the security declines in price between those dates. Any potential 
gain is limited to the price at which the Fund sold the security short, and any potential loss is unlimited in size. 
 
     In connection with its short sales, the Fund will be required to maintain a segregated account with the Fund's custodian of cash 
or liquid assets equal to (i) the greater of the current market value of the securities sold short or the market value of such securities 
at the time they were sold short, less (ii) any collateral deposited with its broker (not including the proceeds from the short sales).  
Depending on arrangements made with the broker or custodian, the Fund may not receive any payments (including interest) on 
collateral deposited with the broker or custodian. 
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     D. Securities Lending. The Fund may make long and short term loans of its portfolio securities to parties such as broker-
dealers, banks, or institutional investors. Securities lending allows a Fund to retain ownership of the securities loaned and, at the 
same time, to earn additional income. Since there may be delays in the recovery of loaned securities, or even a loss of rights in 
collateral supplied, should the borrower fail financially, loans will be made only to parties whose creditworthiness has been 
reviewed and deemed satisfactory by the Adviser. Furthermore, they will only be made if, in the judgment of the Adviser, the 
consideration to be earned from such loans would justify the risk. 
 
     The Adviser understands that it is the current view of the staff of the Securities and Exchange Commission (the "SEC") that a 
Fund may engage in loan transactions only under the following conditions: (1) a Fund must receive 100% collateral in the form of 
cash, cash equivalents (e.g., U.S. Treasury bills or notes) or other high grade liquid debt instruments from the borrower; (2) the 
borrower must increase the collateral whenever the market value of the securities loaned (determined on a daily basis) rises above 
the value of the collateral; (3) after giving notice, the Fund must be able to terminate the loan at any time; (4) the Fund must 
receive reasonable interest on the loan or a flat fee from the borrower, as well as amounts equivalent to any dividends, interest, or 
other distributions on the securities loaned and to any increase in market value; (5) the Fund may pay only reasonable custodian 
fees in connection with the loan; and (6) the Trust’s Board of Trustees (“Board”) must be able to vote proxies on the securities 
loaned, either by terminating the loan or by entering into an alternative arrangement with the borrower. 
 
     Cash received through loan transactions may be invested in any security in which the Fund is authorized to invest. Investing 
this cash subjects that investment, as well as the security loaned, to market forces (i.e., capital appreciation or depreciation). 

     E. Illiquid Investments. In accordance with Rule 22e-4 under the 1940 Act (the “Liquidity Rule”), the Fund may invest up to 
15% of its net assets in “illiquid investments.” For these purposes, “illiquid investments” are investments that cannot reasonably be 
expected to be sold or disposed of in current market conditions in seven calendar days or less without the sale or disposition 
significantly changing the market value of the investment. 
 
      The Fund must classify each portfolio investment at least monthly into one of four liquidity categories (highly liquid, 
moderately liquid, less liquid and illiquid), which are defined pursuant to the Liquidity Rule. Such classification is to be made 
using information obtained after reasonable inquiry and taking into account relevant market, trading and investment-specific 
considerations. Moreover, in making such classification determinations, the Fund determines whether trading varying portions of a 
position in a particular portfolio investment or asset class, in sizes that the Fund would reasonably anticipate trading, is reasonably 
expected to significantly affect its liquidity, and if so, the Fund takes this determination into account when classifying the liquidity 
of that investment. The Fund may be assisted in classification determinations by one or more third-party service providers. 
Investments classified according to this process as “illiquid investments” are those subject to the 15% limit on illiquid investments. 

     F. U.S. Government Securities. U.S. government securities are high-quality debt securities issued or guaranteed by the U.S.  
Treasury or by an agency or instrumentality of the U.S. government.  Not all U.S. government securities are backed by the full 
faith and credit of the United States.  For example, securities issued by the Farm Credit Banks or by the Federal National Mortgage 
Association are supported by the instrumentality's right to borrow money from the U.S. Treasury under certain circumstances.  
However, securities issued by other agencies or instrumentalities are supported only by the credit of the entity that issued them. 
 
     G. Corporate Debt Securities. Corporate debt securities are long and short term debt obligations issued by companies (such as 
publicly issued and privately placed bonds, notes and commercial paper). The Adviser considers corporate debt securities to be of 
investment grade quality if they are rated BBB or higher by S&P or Baa or higher by Moody's, or if unrated, determined by the 
Adviser to be of comparable quality. Investment grade debt securities generally have adequate to strong protection of principal and 
interest payments. In the lower end of this category, adverse economic conditions or changing circumstances are more likely to 
lead to a weakened capacity to pay interest and repay principal than in higher rated categories. 
 
     H. Fixed Income Securities. Under normal market conditions, the Fund may invest in all types of fixed income securities.  The 
Fund may also purchase fixed income securities on a when-issued, delayed delivery, or forward commitment basis. 
 
     Fixed income securities are subject to credit risk and interest rate risk.  Credit risk is the risk that the Fund could lose money if 
an issuer of a fixed income security cannot meet its financial obligations or goes bankrupt.  Interest rate risk is the risk that the 
Fund's investments in fixed income securities may fall when interest rates rise. 
 
     Investments in high-yield bonds are considered to be more speculative than higher quality fixed income securities.  They are 
more susceptible to credit risk than investment-grade securities, especially during periods of economic uncertainty or economic 
downturns.  The values of lower quality securities are subject to greater volatility and are generally more dependent on the ability 
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of the issuer to meet interest and principal payments than higher quality securities.  Issuers of high-yield securities may not be as 
strong financially as those issuing bonds with higher credit ratings. 
 
     I. Financial Services Industry Obligations. The Fund may invest in each of the following obligations of the financial services 
industry: 
 
          (1)  Certificates of Deposit.  Certificates of deposit are negotiable certificates evidencing the indebtedness of a commercial 
bank or a savings and loan association to repay funds deposited with it for a definite period of time (usually from fourteen days to 
one year) at a stated or variable interest rate. 
 
          (2)  Time Deposits.   Time deposits are non-negotiable deposits maintained in a banking institution or a savings and loan 
association for a specified period of time at a stated interest rate. 
 
          (3) Bankers' Acceptances.  Bankers' acceptances are credit instruments evidencing the obligation of a bank to pay a draft 
which has been drawn on it by a customer, which instruments reflect the obligation both of the bank and of the drawer to pay the 
face amount of the instrument upon maturity. 
 
     J. Repurchase Agreements. The Fund may invest in repurchase agreements fully collateralized by obligations issued by the U.S. 
government or agencies of the U.S. government ("U.S. Government Obligations"). A repurchase agreement is a short term 
investment in which the purchaser (i.e., a Fund) acquires ownership of a U.S. Government Obligation (which may be of any 
maturity) and the seller agrees to repurchase the obligation at a future time at a set price, thereby determining the yield during the 
purchaser's holding period (usually not more than 7 days from the date of purchase). Any repurchase transaction in which a Fund 
engages will require full collateralization of the seller's obligation during the entire term of the repurchase agreement. In the event 
of a bankruptcy or other default of the seller, a Fund could experience both delays in liquidating the underlying security and losses 
in value. However, the Fund intends to enter into repurchase agreements only with the custodian, other banks with assets of $1 
billion or more and registered securities dealers determined by the Adviser to be creditworthy. The Adviser monitors the 
creditworthiness of the banks and securities dealers with which a Fund engages in repurchase transactions. 
      
      K. Borrowing. The Fund is permitted to borrow money up to one-third of the value of its total assets for the purpose of 
investment as well as for temporary or emergency purposes. Borrowing for the purpose of investment is a speculative technique 
that increases both investment opportunity and a Fund's ability to achieve greater diversification. However, it also increases 
investment risk. Because the Fund's investments will fluctuate in value, whereas the interest obligations on borrowed funds may be 
fixed, during times of borrowing, the Fund's net asset value may tend to increase more when its investments increase in value, and 
decrease more when its investments decrease in value. In addition, interest costs on borrowings may fluctuate with changing 
market interest rates and may partially offset or exceed the return earned on the borrowed funds. Also, during times of borrowing 
under adverse market conditions, the Fund might have to sell portfolio securities to meet interest or principal payments at a time 
when fundamental investment considerations would not favor such sales. 
 
     L. Options Transactions. The Fund may engage in option transactions involving individual securities and stock indexes. An 
option involves either: (a) the right or the obligation to buy or sell a specific instrument at a specific price until the expiration date 
of the option; or (b) the right to receive payments or the obligation to make payments representing the difference between the 
closing price of a stock index and the exercise price of the option expressed in dollars times a specified multiple until the 
expiration date of the option. Options are sold (written) on securities and stock indexes. The purchaser of an option on a security 
pays the seller (the writer) a premium for the right granted but is not obligated to buy or sell the underlying security. The purchaser 
of an option on a stock index pays the seller a premium for the right granted, and in return the seller of such an option is obligated 
to make the payment. A writer of an option may terminate the obligation prior to expiration of the option by making an offsetting 
purchase of an identical option. Options are traded on organized exchanges and in the over-the-counter market.  
 
     The purchase and writing of options requires additional skills and techniques beyond normal portfolio management, and 
involves certain risks. The purchase of options limits the Fund's potential loss to the amount of the premium paid and can afford 
the Fund the opportunity to profit from favorable movements in the price of an underlying security to a greater extent than if 
transactions were effected in the security directly. However, the purchase of an option could result in the Fund losing a greater 
percentage of its investment than if the transaction were effected directly. When the Fund writes a call option, it will receive a 
premium, but it will give up the opportunity to profit from a price increase in the underlying security above the exercise price as 
long as its obligation as a writer continues, and it will retain the risk of loss should the price of the security decline. When the Fund 
writes a put option, it will assume the risk that the price of the underlying security or instrument will fall below the exercise price, 
in which case the Fund may be required to purchase the security or instrument at a higher price than the market price of the 
security or instrument. In addition, there can be no assurance that the Fund can effect a closing transaction on a particular option it 
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has written. Further, the total premium paid for any option may be lost if the Fund does not exercise the option or, in the case of 
over-the-counter options, the writer does not perform its obligations. 
 
INVESTMENT LIMITATIONS 
 
     Fundamental. The investment limitations described below have been adopted by the Trust with respect to the Fund and are 
fundamental ("Fundamental"), i.e., they may not be changed without the affirmative vote of a majority of the outstanding shares of 
the Fund. As used in the Prospectus and the SAI, the term "majority" of the outstanding shares of the Fund means the lesser of: (1) 
67% or more of the outstanding shares of the Fund present at a meeting, if the holders of more than 50% of the outstanding shares 
of the Fund are present or represented at such meeting; or (2) more than 50% of the outstanding shares of the Fund. Other 
investment practices which may be changed by the Board without the approval of shareholders to the extent permitted by 
applicable law, regulation or regulatory policy are considered non-fundamental ("Non-Fundamental"). 
 
     1. Borrowing Money. The Fund will not borrow money, except: (a) from a bank, provided that immediately after such 
borrowing there is an asset coverage of 300% for all borrowings of the Fund; or (b) from a bank or other persons for temporary 
purposes only, provided that such temporary borrowings are in an amount not exceeding 5% of the Fund's total assets at the time 
when the borrowing is made. This limitation does not preclude the Fund from entering into reverse repurchase transactions, 
provided that the Fund has an asset coverage of 300% for all borrowings and repurchase commitments of the Fund pursuant to 
reverse repurchase transactions. 
 
     2. Senior Securities. The Fund will not issue senior securities. This limitation is not applicable to activities that may be deemed 
to involve the issuance or sale of a senior security by the Fund, provided that the Fund's engagement in such activities is consistent 
with or permitted by the Investment Company Act of 1940, as amended (the “1940 Act”), the rules and regulations promulgated 
thereunder or interpretations of the SEC or its staff. 
 
     3. Underwriting. The Fund will not act as underwriter of securities issued by other persons.  This limitation is not applicable to 
the extent that, in connection with the disposition of portfolio securities (including restricted securities), the Fund may be deemed 
an underwriter under certain federal securities laws. 
 
     4. Real Estate. The Fund will not purchase or sell real estate. This limitation is not applicable to investments in marketable 
securities which are secured by or represent interests in real estate. This limitation does not preclude the Fund from investing in 
mortgage-related securities or investing in companies engaged in the real estate business or that have a significant portion of their 
assets in real estate (including real estate investment trusts). 
 
     5. Commodities. The Fund will not purchase or sell commodities unless acquired as a result of ownership of securities or other 
investments. This limitation does not preclude the Fund from purchasing or selling options or futures contracts, from investing in 
securities or other instruments backed by commodities or from investing in companies which are engaged in a commodities 
business or have a significant portion of their assets in commodities. 
 
     6. Loans.  The Fund will not make loans to other persons, except: (a) by loaning portfolio securities; (b) by engaging in 
repurchase agreements; or (c) by purchasing non-publicly offered debt securities.  For purposes of this limitation, the term "loans" 
shall not include the purchase of a portion of an issue of publicly distributed bonds, debentures or other securities. 
 
     7. Concentration. The Fund will not invest 25% or more of its total assets in a particular industry. This limitation is not 
applicable to investments in obligations issued or guaranteed by the U.S. government, its agencies and instrumentalities or 
repurchase agreements with respect thereto. 
 
     With respect to the percentages adopted by the Trust as maximum limitations on its investment policies and limitations, an 
excess above the fixed percentage will not be a violation of the policy or limitation unless the excess results immediately and 
directly from the acquisition of any security or the action taken. This paragraph does not apply to the borrowing policy set forth in 
paragraph 1 above. 
      
     Notwithstanding any of the foregoing limitations, any investment company, whether organized as a trust, association or 
corporation, or a personal holding company, may be merged or consolidated with or acquired by the Trust, provided that if such 
merger, consolidation or acquisition results in an investment in the securities of any issuer prohibited by said paragraphs, the Trust 
shall, within ninety days after the consummation of such merger, consolidation or acquisition, dispose of all of the securities of 
such issuer so acquired or such portion thereof as shall bring the total investment therein within the limitations imposed by said 
paragraphs above as of the date of consummation. 
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     Non-Fundamental. The following limitations have been adopted by the Trust with respect to the Fund and are Non-
Fundamental (see "Investment Limitations - Fundamental" above). 
 
     1. Pledging. The Fund will not mortgage, pledge, hypothecate or in any manner transfer, as security for indebtedness, any assets 
of the Fund except as may be necessary in connection with borrowings described in limitation (1) above. Margin deposits, security 
interests, liens and collateral arrangements with respect to transactions involving options, futures contracts, short sales and other 
permitted investments and techniques are not deemed to be a mortgage, pledge or hypothecation of assets for purposes of this 
limitation. 
 
     2. Borrowing.  The Fund will not purchase any security while borrowings (including reverse repurchase agreements) 
representing more than one third of its total assets are outstanding. 
 
     3. Margin Purchases. The Fund will not purchase securities or evidences of interest thereon on "margin." This limitation is not 
applicable to short term credit obtained by a Fund for the clearance of purchases and sales or redemption of securities, or to 
arrangements with respect to transactions involving options, futures contracts, short sales and other permitted investments and 
techniques. 
 
     4. Options.  The Fund will not purchase or sell puts, calls, options or straddles, except as described in the Statement of 
Additional Information. 
 
Other Investment Limitations.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 22e-4 of the Act, the Fund will not invest 15% or more of its net assets in illiquid securities such as those where 
there are legal or contractual restrictions on resale and other illiquid securities.  However, if more than 15% of Fund net assets are 
illiquid, the Fund's Adviser will reduce illiquid assets such that they do not represent more than 15%, subject to timing and other 
considerations which are in the best interests of the Fund and its shareholders. 
 
THE INVESTMENT ADVISER 
 
     The Adviser is Check Capital Management Inc., located at 575 Anton Boulevard, Suite 500, Costa Mesa, CA 92626.  As the 
sole shareholder of the Adviser, Steve Check is regarded to control the Adviser for purposes of the 1940 Act. 
 
     Under the terms of the Management Agreement, the Adviser manages the investment portfolio of the Fund, subject to policies 
adopted by the Board.  Under the Management Agreement, the Adviser, at its own expense and without reimbursement from the 
Trust, furnishes office space and all necessary office facilities, equipment and executive personnel necessary for managing the 
assets of the Fund.  The Adviser also pays the salaries and fees of all of its officers and employees that serve as officers and 
trustees of the Trust.  For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2020, the Adviser earned its 1.00% management fees equal to 
$325,955 and waived management fees of $142,899.  For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2021, the Adviser earned its 1.00% 
management fees equal to $441,090 and waived management fees of $151,592. For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2022, the 
Adviser earned its 1.00% management fees equal to $414,521 and waived management fees of $150,044. The Adviser has 
contractually agreed to waive management fees and reimburse expenses, without recoupment, to the extent necessary to maintain 
total annual operating expenses of the Fund (excluding brokerage fees and commissions, interest and other borrowing expenses, 
taxes, extraordinary expenses and the indirect costs of investing in acquired funds) at 1.00% of its average daily net assets through 
April 30, 2024.  
 
     The Adviser retains the right to use the name "Blue Chip Investor" or any derivative thereof in connection with another 
investment company or business enterprise with which the Adviser is or may become associated. The Trust's right to use the name 
"Blue Chip Investor" or any derivative thereof automatically ceases ninety days after termination of the Agreement and may be 
withdrawn by the Adviser on ninety days written notice. 
  
     The Adviser may make payments to banks or other financial institutions that provide shareholder services and administer 
shareholder accounts. If a bank or other financial institution were prohibited from continuing to perform all or a part of such 
services, management of the Fund believes that there would be no material impact on the Fund or its shareholders. Financial 
institutions may charge their customers fees for offering these services to the extent permitted by applicable regulatory authorities, 
and the overall return to those shareholders availing themselves of the financial institution’s services will be lower than to those 
shareholders who do not. The Fund may from time to time purchase securities issued by financial institutions that provide such 
services; however, in selecting investments for the Fund, no preference will be shown for such securities. 
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THE PORTFOLIO MANAGERS 
 
     Mr. Steve Check and Ryan Kinney (the “Portfolio Managers”) are the portfolio managers responsible for the day-to-day 
management of the Fund.  Mr. Check also manages separate accounts for individuals, trusts, corporations, partnerships and 
retirement plans. The following provides information regarding other accounts managed by Mr. Check and Mr. Kinney as of 
December 31, 2022:  
 
Steve Check 
 

Account Type 
Number of Accounts 
by Account Type 

Total Assets By 
Account Type 

Number of Accounts 
by Type Subject to a 
Performance Fee 

Total Assets By 
Account Type 
Subject to a 
Performance Fee 

Registered 
Investment 
Companies 

- - - - 

Other Pooled 
Investment Vehicles 

- - - - 

Other Accounts 2,175 $1,403,109,481 1,422 $1,081,637,671 
  
Ryan Kinney 
 

Account Type 
Number of Accounts 
by Account Type 

Total Assets By 
Account Type 

Number of Accounts 
by Type Subject to a 
Performance Fee 

Total Assets By 
Account Type 
Subject to a 
Performance Fee 

Registered 
Investment 
Companies 

- - - - 

Other Pooled 
Investment Vehicles 

- - - - 

Other Accounts - - - - 
 
     The Adviser offers several wealth management models in which their private client group (separately managed accounts) 
participate. These offerings include portfolios of investment substantially identical to the Fund, which could create certain conflicts 
of interest.  As the Fund and any separate accounts managed similarly to the Fund will be managed concurrently, all portfolio 
transactions are implemented according to the Adviser’s trade allocation procedures and side-by-side policies. These procedures, 
among other things, insure that all trades allocated to advisory clients (including the Fund) fulfill the Adviser’s fiduciary duty to 
each client and otherwise allocate securities on a basis that is fair and nondiscriminatory. Such procedures are generally applied in 
numerous instances, including, among other things, block and bunched trades. In determining a fair allocation, the Adviser takes 
into account a number of factors, including among other things, the Adviser’s fiduciary duty to each client, any potential conflicts 
of interest, the size of the transaction, the relative size of a client’s portfolio, cash available for investment suitability, as well as 
each client’s investment objectives.  
  
     Mr. Check’s trust owns all the outstanding shares of the Adviser and therefore his compensation is largely based on the profits 
realized by the Adviser for managing the Fund and the Adviser’s other clients (he is also paid a base salary).  He participates 
directly in all profits and losses of the Adviser, including the advisory fees paid by the Funds.  There are no bonuses, deferred 
compensation or retirement plans associated with his service to the Funds.   Mr. Kinney’s compensation is based on a salary plus a 
bonus based on the profitability of the Adviser. 
 
     The following table shows the dollar range of equity securities beneficially owned by each Portfolio Manager in the Fund as of 
December 31, 2022. 
   

Name of Portfolio Manager Dollar Range of Equity Securities in 
the Fund 

Mr. Steve Check None 
Mr. Ryan Kinney None 
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TRUSTEES AND OFFICERS 
 
     The Board supervises the business activities of the Trust.  The Board has engaged the Adviser to manage and/or administer the 
Trust and is responsible for overseeing the Adviser and other service providers to the Trust and the Fund. The Board is currently 
composed of two Trustees, including one Trustee who is not an "interested persons" of the Fund, as that term is defined in the 1940 
Act (each an “Independent Trustee”). In addition to four regularly scheduled meetings per year, the Board holds special meetings 
or informal conference calls to discuss specific matters that may require action prior to the next regular meeting. The Board has 
established an Audit Committee comprised entirely of Trustees who are Independent Trustees.  The Audit Committee is generally 
responsible for (i) overseeing and monitoring the Trust's internal accounting and control structure, its auditing function and its 
financial reporting process, (ii) selecting and recommending to the full Board the appointment of auditors for the Trust, (iii) 
reviewing audit plans, fees, and other material arrangements with respect to the engagement of auditors, including permissible 
non-audit services performed; (iv) reviewing the qualifications of the auditor's key personnel involved in the foregoing activities 
and (v) monitoring the auditor's independence. 

     Mutual funds face a number of risks, including investment risk, compliance risk and valuation risk.  The Board oversees 
management of the Fund’s risks directly and through its officers.  While day-to-day risk management responsibilities rest with the 
Fund’s Chief Compliance Officer, investment adviser and other service providers, the Board monitors and tracks risk by: (1) 
receiving and reviewing quarterly reports related to the performance and operations of the Funds; (2) reviewing and approving, as 
applicable, the compliance policies and procedures of the Trust, including the Trust’s valuation policies and transaction 
procedures; (3) periodically meeting with the portfolio manager to review investment strategies, techniques and related risks; (4) 
meeting with representatives of key service providers, including the Fund’s  investment adviser, administrator, transfer agent, the 
custodian and the independent registered public accounting firm, to discuss the activities of the Funds; (5) engaging the services of 
the Chief Compliance Officer of the Fund to test the compliance procedures of the Trust and its service providers; (6) receiving 
and reviewing reports from the Trust’s independent registered public accounting firm regarding the Fund’s financial condition and 
the Trust’s internal controls; and (7) receiving and reviewing an annual written report prepared by the Chief Compliance Officer 
reviewing the adequacy of the Trust’s compliance policies and procedures and the effectiveness of their implementation.  The 
Board has concluded that its general oversight of the investment adviser and other service providers as implemented through the 
reporting and monitoring process outlined above allows the Board to effectively administer its risk oversight function. 

     Each Trustee was nominated to serve on the Board based on their particular experiences, qualifications, attributes and skills.  
The characteristics that have led the Board to conclude that each of the Trustees should continue to serve as a Trustee of the Trust 
are discussed below. 

Jeffrey R. Provence. Mr. Jeffrey R. Provence has served as a Trustee since the Trust’s inception in 2001. Mr. Jeffrey R. Provence 
is the CEO of Premier Fund Solutions, Inc. which provides the Board with knowledge related to fund administration. Mr. Jeffrey 
R. Provence is also a General Partner of Value Trend Capital Management, LP, and has worked in the investment management 
industry since 1995 providing investment management knowledge to the Board. 

Robert L. Boerner.  Mr. Boerner has served as a Trustee since May 1, 2023. He has been a licensed real estate broker for over 20 
years and also has experience as a licensed mortgage lender.  Mr. Boerner has extensive experience representing residential buyers 
and sellers and strong ability to understand complex financial and financing aspects of transactions. The Board of Trustees 
believes his experience with the complexities of the highly-regulated aspects of real estate, mortgage lending and sales translate 
well to the highly-regulated environment under which mutual funds must operate.  Consequently, he has experience overseeing 
layers of regulatory conditions under which an entity must operate which parallels the operations of mutual funds. 

Allen C. Brown. Mr. Brown has served as a Trustee since the Trust’s inception in 2001.  He was an estate planning and business 
attorney from 1970 to 2021.  As a practicing attorney for over five decades, Mr. Brown provides a valued legal perspective to the 
Board of Trustees. 
 
The names of the Trustees and executive officers of the Trust are shown below.  Each Trustee who is an "interested person" of the 
Trust, as defined in the Investment Company Act of 1940, is indicated by an asterisk.  The trustees and officers of the Trust and 
their principal business activities during the past five years are: 
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Interested Trustee and Officers 
 

Name,  
   Address,(1) 

and Age 
 

 
Position 

with 
the Trust 

 
Length 
of Time 
Served 

 
Principal Occupation(s) 

During 
Past 5 Years 

 

 
Number of 
Portfolios 

Overseen By 
Trustee 

 
Other 

Directorships 
Held By 
 Trustee 

 
 

James D. Craft, Year of Birth: 
1982 
 

 
President 

 

 
Since 2023 

 
 
 

 

 
Fund Administrator, 
Premier Fund Solutions, 
Inc. (2007-present); Chief 
Technology Officer, 
Premier Fund Solutions, 
Inc. (2011 to present). 

 
N/A 

 
 
 
 

 

 
N/A 

 
 
 
 

 
Jeffrey R. Provence(2), Year of 
Birth: 1969 
 

 
Secretary, 
Treasurer 

and Trustee 

 
Since 2001 

 
CEO, Premier Fund 
Solutions, Inc. (2001-
Present).  General Partner 
and Portfolio Manager for 
Value Trend Capital 
Management, LP (1995 to 
current).   

 
1 

 
 PFS Funds, 

Meeder Funds 

 
Jock Meeks, Year of Birth: 
1956 
 

 
Chief 

Compliance 
Officer 

 
Since 2004 

 
Client Services Director for 
Check Capital Management 
(2004 to current).  

 
N/A 

 
N/A 

(1)The address of each officer and trustee is c/o Blue Chip Investor Fund, 1939 Friendship Drive, Suite C, El Cajon, California 92020. 
(2)Jeffrey R. Provence is considered an "interested persons" as defined in Section 2(a)(19) of the Investment Company Act of 1940 due to his 
position as an officer of the Trust. 
 
    The following table provides information regarding each Trustee who is not an “interested person” of the Trust, as defined in the 
Investment Company Act of 1940. 
 
Independent Trustee 

 
Name,  

   Address,(1) 
and Age 

 

 
Position 

with 
the Trust 

 
Length 
of Time 
Served 

 
Principal Occupation(s) 

During 
Past 5 Years 

 

 
Number of 
Portfolios 

Overseen By 
Trustee 

 
Other 

Directorships 
Held By 
Trustee 

 
 
Robert L. Boerner, Year of 
Birth: 1969 
 

 
Independent 

Trustee 

 
Since 2023 

 
Owner / Broker of Gecko 
Realty (2008 to current) 

 
1 

 
PFS Funds 

 
Allen C. Brown, Year of 
Birth: 1943 
 

 
Independent 

Trustee 

 
Since 2001 

 
Retired. Law Office of 
Allen C. Brown. Estate 
planning and business 
attorney (1970 to 2021). 

 
1 

 
PFS Funds 

(1)The address of each trustee is c/o Blue Chip Investor Fund, 1939 Friendship Drive, Suite C, El Cajon, California 92020. 
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BOARD INTEREST IN THE TRUST 
 
As of December 31, 2022, the Trustees owned the following amounts in the Trust: 
 

 
Name of Trustee or Officer 

Dollar Range of Securities In The 
Blue Chip Investor Fund 

Aggregate Dollar Range of Securities In 
Trust 

Jeffrey R. Provence $1 - $10,000 $1 - $10,000 
Robert L. Boerner None None 
Allen C. Brown None None 

 
COMPENSATION 
 
     Trustee fees are paid by the Trust. Officers and Trustees of the Fund who are deemed "interested persons" of the Trust receive 
no compensation from the Fund.  The following table provides information regarding Trustee compensation for the fiscal year 
ended December 31, 2022. 
 

Name Total Compensation from Trust 
Jeffrey R. Provence $0 
Robert L. Boerner $0 
Allen C. Brown $2,300  

CONTROL PERSONS AND PRINCIPAL HOLDERS OF SECURITIES  

     A principal shareholder is any person who owns (either of record or beneficially) 5% or more of the outstanding shares of the 
Fund.  A control person is one who owns, either directly or indirectly, more than 25% of the voting securities of a company or 
acknowledges the existence of such control.  As of April 3, 2023, the following shareholders were considered to be either a control 
person or principal shareholder of the Fund: 

Name and Address Shares Percent Ownership Type of Ownership 
Charles Schwab & Co. Inc.,  
101 Montgomery Street 
San Francisco, CA 94104 

134,427.76 

 

61.37% Record 

National Financial Services, LLC  
200 Liberty Street 
New York, NY 10281 

83,026.82 37.90% Record 

 
  As of April 3, 2023, the Adviser shared with certain of its advisory clients the power to vote, and investment discretion with 
respect to more than 90% of the outstanding shares of the Fund recorded at Charles Schwab & Co. and National Investor Services 
Corp.  As a result, the Adviser may be deemed to beneficially control these shares and may be deemed to control the Fund.  As the 
controlling shareholder, the Adviser could control the outcome of any proposal submitted to the shareholders for approval, 
including changes to the Fund’s fundamental policies or the terms of the management agreement with the Adviser.  As of April 3, 
2023, the trustees and officers owned less than 1% of the shares of the Fund. 
 
AUDIT COMMITTEE 
 
     The Board has an Audit Committee, which is comprised of the independent members of the Board Allen C. Brown and Robert 
L. Boerner.  The Audit Committee meets at least once a year, or more often as required, in conjunction with meetings of the Board. 
The Audit Committee oversees and monitors the Trust's internal accounting and control structure, its auditing function and its 
financial reporting process. The Audit Committee selects the auditors and recommends to the full Board the appointment of 
auditors for the Trust. The Audit Committee also reviews audit plans, fees, and other material arrangements with respect to the 
engagement of auditors, including permissible non-audit services performed. It reviews the qualifications of the auditor's key 
personnel involved in the foregoing activities and monitors the auditor's independence.  During the fiscal year ended December 31, 
2022, the Audit Committee met three times. 
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PORTFOLIO TRANSACTIONS AND BROKERAGE 
 
     Subject to policies established by the Board, the Adviser is responsible for the Fund's portfolio decisions and the placing of the 
Fund's portfolio transactions. In placing portfolio transactions, the Adviser seeks the best qualitative execution for the Fund, taking 
into account such factors as price (including the applicable brokerage commission or dealer spread), the execution capability, 
financial responsibility and responsiveness of the broker or dealer and the brokerage and research services provided by the broker 
or dealer. The Adviser generally seeks favorable prices and commission rates that are reasonable in relation to the benefits 
received. The Adviser may not give consideration to sales of shares of the Trust as a factor in the selection of brokers and dealers 
to execute portfolio transactions.  However, the Adviser may place portfolio transactions with brokers or dealers that promote or 
sell the Fund’s shares so long as such placements are made pursuant to policies approved by the Fund’s Board that are designed to 
ensure that the selection is based on the quality of the broker’s execution and not on its sales efforts. 
 
     The Adviser is specifically authorized to select brokers or dealers who also provide brokerage and research services to the Fund 
and/or the other accounts over which the Adviser exercises investment discretion and to pay such brokers or dealers a commission 
in excess of the commission another broker or dealer would charge if the Adviser determines in good faith that the commission is 
reasonable in relation to the value of the brokerage and research services provided. The determination may be viewed in terms of a 
particular transaction or the Adviser's overall responsibilities with respect to the Trust and to other accounts over which it exercises 
investment discretion. 
 
     Research services include supplemental research, securities and economic analyses, statistical services and information with 
respect to the availability of securities or purchasers or sellers of securities and analyses of reports concerning performance of 
accounts. The research services and other information furnished by brokers through whom the Fund effect securities transactions 
may also be used by the Adviser in servicing all of its accounts. Similarly, research and information provided by brokers or dealers 
serving other clients may be useful to the Adviser in connection with its services to the Fund. Although research services and other 
information are useful to the Fund and the Adviser, it is not possible to place a dollar value on the research and other information 
received. It is the opinion of the Board and the Adviser that the review and study of the research and other information will not 
reduce the overall cost to the Adviser of performing its duties to the Fund under the Agreement. Due to research services provided 
by brokers, the Blue Chip Investor Fund may direct trades to certain brokers.  
 
     Over-the-counter transactions will be placed either directly with principal market makers or with broker-dealers, if the same or 
a better price, including commissions and executions, is available. Fixed income securities are normally purchased directly from 
the issuer, an underwriter or a market maker. Purchases include a concession paid by the issuer to the underwriter and the purchase 
price paid to a market maker may include the spread between the bid and asked prices. 
 
     When the Fund and another of the Adviser's clients seek to purchase or sell the same security at or about the same time, the 
Adviser may execute the transaction on a combined ("blocked") basis. Blocked transactions can produce better execution for the 
Fund because of the increased volume of the transaction. If the entire blocked order is not filled, the Fund may not be able to 
acquire as large a position in such security as it desires or it may have to pay a higher price for the security. Similarly, the Fund 
may not be able to obtain as large an execution of an order to sell or as high a price for any particular portfolio security if the other 
client desires to sell the same portfolio security at the same time. In the event that the entire blocked order is not filled, the 
purchase or sale will normally be allocated on a pro rata basis. The allocation may be adjusted by the Adviser, taking into account 
such factors as the size of the individual orders and transaction costs, when the Adviser believes an adjustment is reasonable. 
 
     The Trust and the Adviser have each adopted a Code of Ethics (the "Code") under Rule 17j-1 of the Investment Company Act 
of 1940. The personnel subject to the Code are permitted to invest in securities, including securities that may be purchased or held 
by the Fund. You may obtain a copy of the Code from the SEC. 
 
     For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2020, the Fund paid brokerage commissions of $225. For the fiscal year ended 
December 31, 2021, the Fund paid brokerage commissions of $275. For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2022, the Fund paid 
brokerage commissions of $200.  
 
ADDITIONAL TAX INFORMATION 
 
     The following discussion of certain U.S. federal income tax consequences is general in nature and should not be regarded as an 
exhaustive presentation of all possible tax ramifications.  Each shareholder should consult a qualified tax advisor regarding the tax 
consequences of an investment in the Fund.  The tax considerations relevant to a specific shareholder depend upon the 
shareholder’s specific circumstances, and the following general summary does not attempt to discuss all potential tax 
considerations that could be relevant to a prospective shareholder with respect to the Fund or its investments.  This general 
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summary is based on the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended (the “Code”), the U.S. federal income tax regulations 
promulgated thereunder, and administrative and judicial interpretations thereof as of the date hereof, all of which are subject to 
change (potentially on a retroactive basis). 
 
     The Fund intends to qualify each year as a regulated investment company under Subchapter M of the Code, which requires 
compliance with certain requirements concerning the sources of its income, diversification of its assets, and the amount and timing 
of its distributions to shareholders.  Such qualification does not involve supervision of management or investment practices or 
policies by any government agency or bureau.  By so qualifying, the Fund should not be subject to federal income or excise tax on 
its net investment income or net realized capital gain, which are distributed to shareholders in accordance with the applicable 
timing requirements. 
    
     The Fund intends to distribute substantially all of its net investment income (including any excess of net short-term capital 
gains over net long-term capital losses) and net realized capital gain (that is, any excess of net long-term capital gains over net 
short-term capital losses) in accordance with the timing requirements imposed by the Code and therefore should not be required to 
pay any federal income or excise taxes.  Net realized capital gain for a fiscal year is computed by taking into account any capital 
loss carryforward of the Fund. 
 
     To be treated as a regulated investment company under Subchapter M of the Code, the Fund must also (a) derive at least 90% 
of its gross income from dividends, interest, payments with respect to securities loans, net income from certain publicly traded 
partnerships and gains from the sale or other disposition of securities or foreign currencies, or other income (including, but not 
limited to, gains from options, futures or forward contracts) derived with respect to the business of investing in such securities or 
currencies, and (b) diversify its holding so that, at the end of each fiscal quarter, (i) at least 50% of the market value of a Fund’s 
assets is represented by cash, U.S. government securities and securities of other regulated investment companies, and other 
securities (for purposes of this calculation, generally limited in respect of any one issuer, to an amount not greater than 5% of the 
market value of a Fund’s assets and 10% of the outstanding voting securities of such issuer) and (ii) not more than 25% of the 
value of its assets is invested in the securities (other than U.S. government securities or the securities of other regulated investment 
companies) of any one issuer, two or more issuers which a Fund controls and which are determined to be engaged in the same or 
similar trades or businesses, or the securities of certain publicly traded partnerships. 
 
     If a Fund fails to qualify as a regulated investment company under Subchapter M in any fiscal year, it may be treated as a 
corporation for federal income tax purposes.  As such, a Fund would be required to pay income taxes on its net investment income 
and net realized capital gains, if any, at the rates generally applicable to corporations.  Shareholders of a Fund generally would not 
be liable for income tax on a Fund’s net investment income or net realized capital gains in their individual capacities.  However, 
distributions to shareholders, whether from a Fund’s net investment income or net realized capital gains, would be treated as 
taxable dividends to the extent of current or accumulated earnings and profits of a Fund.  
 
     As a regulated investment company, a Fund is subject to a 4% nondeductible excise tax on certain undistributed amounts of 
ordinary income and net realized capital gain under a prescribed formula contained in Section 4982 of the Code. The formula 
requires payment to shareholders during a calendar year of distributions representing at least 98% of a Fund’s ordinary income for 
the calendar year and at least 98.2% of its net realized capital gain (i.e., the excess of its capital gains over capital losses) realized 
during the one-year period ending October 31 (unless a fund makes an election under section 4982(e)(4) to substitute such tax year 
end for November or December) during such year plus 100% of any income that was neither distributed nor taxed to a Fund during 
the preceding calendar year. Under ordinary circumstances, a Fund expects to time its distributions so as to avoid liability for this 
tax.  
 
     The following discussion of U.S. federal income tax consequences is for the general information of shareholders that are 
subject to tax.  Shareholders that are invested in IRAs or other qualified retirement plans are exempt from income taxation under 
the Code.  
 
     Distributions of taxable net investment income (including the excess of net short-term capital gain over net long-term realized 
capital loss) generally are taxable to shareholders as ordinary income.  However, distributions by the Fund to a non-corporate 
shareholder may be subject to income tax at the shareholder’s applicable tax rate for long-term capital gain, to the extent that the 
Fund receives qualified dividend income on the securities it holds, the Fund properly designates the distribution as qualified 
dividend income, and the Fund and the non-corporate shareholder receiving the distribution meets certain holding period and other 
requirements.  Distributions of net realized capital gain (“capital gain dividends”) generally are taxable to shareholders as long-
term capital gain, regardless of the length of time the shares of the Trust have been held by such shareholders.  Under current law, 
capital gain dividends recognized by a non-corporate shareholder generally will be taxed at a maximum income tax rate of 20%.  
Capital gains of corporate shareholders are taxed at the same rate as ordinary income. 
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     Distributions of taxable net investment income and net realized capital gain will be taxable as described above, whether 
received in additional cash or shares.  All distributions of taxable net investment income and net realized capital gain, whether 
received in shares or in cash, must be reported by each taxable shareholder on his or her federal income tax return. Dividends or 
distributions declared in October, November or December as of a record date in such a month, if any, will be deemed to have been 
received by shareholders on December 31, if paid during January of the following year. Redemptions of shares may result in tax 
consequences (gain or loss) to the shareholder and are also subject to these reporting requirements.  
 
     Redemption of Fund shares by a shareholder will result in the recognition of taxable gain or loss in an amount equal to the 
difference between the amount realized and the shareholder’s tax basis in the shareholder's Fund shares. Such gain or loss is 
treated as a capital gain or loss if the shares are held as capital assets.  However, any loss realized upon the redemption of shares 
within six months from the date of their purchase will be treated as a long-term capital loss to the extent of any amounts treated as 
capital gain dividends during such six-month period.  All or a portion of any loss realized upon the redemption of shares may be 
disallowed to the extent shares are purchased (including shares acquired by means of reinvested dividends) within 30 days before 
or after such redemption. 
 
     Under the Code, a Fund will be required to report to the Internal Revenue Service all distributions of taxable income and net 
realized capital gains as well as gross proceeds from the redemption or exchange of Fund shares, except in the case of certain 
exempt shareholders. Under the backup withholding provisions of Section 3406 of the Code, distributions of taxable net 
investment income and net realized capital gain and proceeds from the redemption or exchange of the shares of a regulated 
investment company may be subject to withholding of federal income tax (currently, at a rate of 28%) in the case of non-exempt 
shareholders who fail to furnish the investment company with their taxpayer identification numbers and with required 
certifications regarding their status under the federal income tax law, or if a Fund is notified by the IRS or a broker that 
withholding is required due to an incorrect TIN or a previous failure to report taxable interest or dividends. If the withholding 
provisions are applicable, any such distributions and proceeds, whether taken in cash or reinvested in additional shares, will be 
reduced by the amounts required to be withheld.  
 
     For taxable years beginning after December 31, 2012, an additional 3.8% Medicare tax generally will be imposed on certain net 
investment income (including ordinary dividends and capital gain distributions received from the Fund and net gains from 
redemptions or other taxable dispositions of Fund shares) of U.S. individuals, estates and trusts to the extent that any such person’s 
“modified adjusted gross income” (in the case of an individual) or “adjusted gross income” (in the case of an estate or trust) 
exceeds certain threshold amounts. 
 
     Shareholders should consult their tax advisers about the application of federal, state, local and foreign tax law in light of their 
particular situation. 

     Should additional series, or funds, be created by the Trustees, each fund would be treated as a separate tax entity for federal 
income tax purposes. 

PRICING OF FUND SHARES 

     The price (net asset value) of the shares of the Fund is determined as of 4:00 p.m., Eastern time on each day the Trust is open 
for business and on any other day on which there is sufficient trading in the Fund's securities to materially affect the net asset 
value. The Trust is open for business on every day except Saturdays, Sundays and the following holidays: New Year's Day, Martin 
Luther King Day, President's Day, Good Friday, Memorial Day, Juneteenth, Independence Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving and 
Christmas. 
 
    Equity securities generally are valued on the basis of prices furnished by a price reporting service when the Equity securities 
generally are valued by using market quotations, but may be valued on the basis of prices furnished by a pricing service when the 
Fund believes such prices accurately reflect the fair value of such securities. Securities that are traded on an exchange or on the 
NASDAQ over-the-counter market are generally valued at the last quoted sale price. Lacking a last sale price, an equity security is 
generally valued by the pricing service at its last bid price. If market prices or, in the opinion of Fund management including as 
informed by the Advisor’s opinion, market prices do not reflect fair value, or if events occur after the close of trading (but prior to 
the time the NAV is calculated) that materially affects fair value, the Fund through the Advisor may value the Fund’s assets at 
their fair value according to policies approved by the Fund’s Board of Trustees (the “Trustees” or the “Board”).  
 
     Fixed income securities generally are valued by using prices provided by a pricing service approved by the Board of Trustees. 
A pricing service utilizes electronic data processing techniques based on yield spreads relating to securities with similar 
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characteristics to determine prices for normal institutional-size trading units of debt securities without regard to sale or bid prices. 
If the Fund as informed by the Advisor’s opinion decides that a price provided by the pricing service does not accurately reflect the 
fair market value of the securities, when prices are not readily available from a pricing service or when restricted or illiquid 
securities are being valued, securities are valued at fair value according to policies approved by the Fund’s Board.  
 
PURCHASES AND SALES THROUGH BROKER DEALERS      
 
     The Fund may be purchased through broker dealers and other intermediaries. The Fund has authorized one or more brokers to 
receive on its behalf purchase and redemption orders.  Such brokers are authorized to designate other intermediaries to receive 
purchase and redemption orders on the Fund's behalf.  The Fund will be deemed to have received a purchase or redemption order 
when an authorized broker or, if applicable, a broker's authorized designee, received the order in proper form. Customer orders 
will be priced at the Fund's net asset value next computed after they are received by an authorized broker or the broker's authorized 
designee. 
 
ANTI-MONEY LAUNDERING PROGRAM 
 
     The Trust has established an Anti-Money Laundering Compliance Program (the "Program") as required by the Uniting and 
Strengthening America by Providing Appropriate Tools Required to Intercept and Obstruct Terrorism Act of 2001 ("USA 
PATRIOT Act"). To ensure compliance with this law, the Trust's Program provides for the development of internal practices, 
procedures and controls, designation of anti-money laundering compliance officers, an ongoing training program and an 
independent audit function to determine the effectiveness of the Program. 
 
     Procedures to implement the Program include, but are not limited to, determining that the Fund's transfer agent has established 
proper anti-money laundering procedures, reporting suspicious and/or fraudulent activity and a complete and thorough review of 
all new account applications.  The Fund will not transact business with any person or entity whose identity cannot be adequately 
verified under the provisions of the USA PATRIOT Act. 
 
CUSTODIAN 
 
          US Bank N.A., 425 Walnut Street, Cincinnati, Ohio 45202, is custodian of the Fund's investments.  The custodian acts as the 
Fund's depository, safekeeps its portfolio securities, collects all income and other payments with respect thereto, disburses funds at 
the Fund's request and maintains records in connection with its duties. 
 
FUND SERVICES 
 
     Mutual Shareholder Services, LLC. (“MSS”), 8000 Town Centre Drive, Suite 400, Broadview Heights, OH 44147 acts as the 
Fund's transfer agent. MSS maintains the records of the shareholder's account, answers shareholders' inquiries concerning their 
accounts, processes purchases and redemptions of the Fund's shares, acts as dividend and distribution disbursing agent and 
performs other transfer agent and shareholder service functions. MSS receives an annual fee from the Fund of $11.50 per 
shareholder (subject to a minimum monthly fee of $775) for these transfer agency services. 
 
     In addition, MSS provides the Fund with fund accounting services, which includes certain monthly reports, record-keeping and 
other management-related services. For its services as fund accountant, MSS receives an annual fee from the Fund based on the 
average value of the Fund.  These fees are: from $0 to $25 million in assets the annual fee is $21,000, from $25 million to $50 
million in assets the annual fee is $30,500, from $50 million to $75 million in assets the annual fee is $36,250, from $75 million to 
$100 million in assets the annual fee is $42,000, from $100 million to $125 million in assets the annual fee is $47,750, from $125 
million to $150 million in assets the annual fee is $53,500, and for assets above $150 million the annual fee is $59,250.  For the 
fiscal year ended December 31, 2020, the Fund paid MSS $42,746 for transfer agent and accounting services.  For the fiscal year 
ended December 31, 2021, the fund paid MSS $42,746 for transfer agent and accounting services. For the fiscal year ended 
December 31, 2022, the fund paid MSS $42,696 for transfer agent and accounting services. 
 
     Premier Fund Solutions, Inc. (“PFS”) provides the Fund with administrative services, including regulatory reporting and 
necessary office equipment, personnel and facilities. PFS receives a monthly fee from the Fund equal to an annual rate of 0.07% of 
the Fund's assets under $200 million, 0.05% of the next $500 million of the Fund's average daily net assets, and 0.03% of the 
average daily net assets of the Fund thereafter (subject to a minimum monthly fee of $2,000).  A Trustee of the Trust is the CEO of 
PFS. For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2020, the Fund paid PFS $24,359. For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2021, the 
Fund paid PFS $30,948. For the fiscal year ended December 31, 2022, the Fund paid PFS $29,037. 
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INDEPENDENT REGISTERED PUBLIC ACCOUNTING FIRM 
 
     The firm of Cohen & Company, Ltd., 342 N. Water Street, Suite 830, Milwaukee, WI  53202, has been selected as the 
independent registered public accounting firm for the Fund for the fiscal year ending December 31, 2023.  Cohen & Company, 
Ltd. performs an annual audit of the Fund's financial statements and provides financial, tax and accounting consulting services as 
requested. 
 
DISCLOSURE OF PORTFOLIO HOLDINGS 
 
     The Fund is required to include a schedule of portfolio holdings in its annual and semi-annual reports to shareholders, which is 
sent to shareholders within 60 days of the end of the second and fourth fiscal quarters and which is filed with the Securities and 
Exchange Commission (the “SEC”) on Form N-CSR within 70 days of the end of the second and fourth fiscal quarters.  The Fund 
also is required to file a schedule of portfolio holdings with the SEC on Form N-PORT within 60 days of the end of the first and 
third fiscal quarters.  The Fund must provide a copy of the complete schedule of portfolio holdings as filed with the SEC to any 
shareholder of the Fund, upon request, free of charge.  This policy is applied uniformly to all shareholders of the Fund without 
regard to the type of requesting shareholder (i.e., regardless of whether the shareholder is an individual or institutional investor).   
 
     The Fund releases portfolio holdings to third party servicing agents on a daily basis in order for those parties to perform their 
duties on behalf of the Fund.  These third party servicing agents include the Adviser, Transfer Agent, Fund Accounting Agent, 
Administrator and Custodian.  The Fund also may disclose portfolio holdings, as needed, to auditors, legal counsel, proxy voting 
services, pricing services, parties to merger and reorganization agreements and their agents, and prospective or newly hired 
investment advisers or sub-advisers.  This information is disclosed to third parties under conditions of confidentiality.  “Conditions 
of confidentiality” include (i) confidentiality clauses in written agreements, (ii) confidentiality implied by the nature of the 
relationship (e.g., attorney-client relationship), (iii) confidentiality required by fiduciary or regulatory principles (e.g., custody 
relationships) or (iv) understandings or expectations between the parties that the information will be kept confidential.  
Additionally, the Fund may release portfolio holdings to third party rating agencies and data reporting platforms on a periodic 
basis.  In these instances, portfolio holdings will be supplied no more often than quarterly and on a delayed basis. 
 
     Except as described above, the Fund is prohibited from entering into any arrangements with any person to make available 
information about the Fund’s portfolio holdings without the specific approval of the Board.  The Adviser must submit any 
proposed arrangement pursuant to which the Adviser intends to disclose the Fund’s portfolio holdings to the Board, which will 
review such arrangement to determine whether the arrangement is in the best interests of Fund shareholders. Additionally, the 
Adviser, and any affiliated persons of the Adviser, is prohibited from receiving compensation or other consideration, for 
themselves or on behalf of the Fund, as a result of disclosing the Fund’s portfolio holdings. 
 
FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
 
     The financial statements and independent registered public accounting firm’s report required to be included in the SAI are 
incorporated herein by reference to the Trust's Annual Report to Shareholders for the fiscal year ended December 31, 2022.  The 
Trust will provide the Annual Report without charge at written or telephone request. 
 
PROXY VOTING POLICIES 

     The Board of the Trust has delegated responsibilities for decisions regarding proxy voting for securities held by the Fund to the 
Fund’s Adviser.  The Adviser will vote such proxies in accordance with its proxy policies and procedures.  In some instances, the 
Adviser may be asked to cast a proxy vote that presents a conflict between the interests of the Fund’s shareholders, and those of the 
Adviser or an affiliated person of the Adviser.  In such a case, the Trust’s policy requires that the Adviser abstain from making a 
voting decision and to forward all necessary proxy voting materials to the Trust to enable the Board to make a voting decision.  When 
the Board of the Trust is required to make a proxy voting decision, only the Trustees without a conflict of interest with regard to the 
security in question or the matter to be voted upon shall be permitted to participate in the decision of how the Fund’s vote will be 
cast. 

The Adviser’s policies and procedures state that the Adviser generally relies on the individual portfolio manager(s) to make the 
final decision on how to cast proxy votes.  When exercising its voting responsibilities, the Adviser’s policies call for an emphasis on 
(i) accountability of management of the company to its board, and of the board to the company’s shareholders, (ii) alignment of 
management and shareholder interests and (iii) transparency through timely disclosure of important information about a company’s 
operations and financial performance.  While no set of proxy voting guidelines can anticipate all situations that may arise, the Adviser 

https://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/1162127/000141304223000155/bcifn-csr12312022.htm
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has adopted guidelines describing the Adviser’s general philosophy when proposals involve certain matters.  The following is a 
summary of those guidelines: 

• electing a board of directors – a board should be composed primarily of independent directors, and key board committees 
should be entirely independent.  The Adviser generally supports efforts to declassify boards or other measures that permit 
shareholders to remove a majority of directors at any time; 

• approving independent auditors – the relationship between a company and its auditors should be limited primarily to the 
audit engagement;  

• providing equity-based compensation plans - appropriately designed equity-based compensation plans, approved by 
shareholders, can be an effective way to align the interests of shareholders and the interests of directors, management, and 
employees by providing incentives to increase shareholder value.  Conversely, the Adviser is opposed to plans that 
substantially dilute ownership interests in the company, provide participants with excessive awards, or have inherently 
objectionable structural features; 

• corporate voting structure - shareholders should have voting power equal to their equity interest in the company and should 
be able to approve or reject changes to a company’s by-laws by a simple majority vote.  The Adviser opposes super-majority 
requirements and generally supports the ability of shareholders to cumulate their votes for the election of directors; and 

• shareholder rights plans - shareholder rights plans, also known as poison pills, may tend to entrench current management, 
which the Adviser generally considers to have a negative impact on shareholder value. 

 

MORE INFORMATION 

The actual voting records relating to portfolio securities during the most recent 12-Month period ended June 30 will be 
available after August 31 without charge, upon request by calling toll-free, 1-877-673-3119 or by accessing the SEC’s website at 
www.sec.gov.   In addition, a copy of the Fund’s proxy voting policies and procedures are also available by calling 1-877-673-
3119 and it will be sent within three business days of receipt of a request. 


	BLUE CHIP INVESTOR FUND (BCIFX)
	STATEMENT OF ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
	DESCRIPTION OF THE TRUST AND THE FUND
	ADDITIONAL INFORMATION ABOUT FUND INVESTMENTS AND RISK CONSIDERATIONS
	This section contains a discussion of some of the investments the Fund may make and some of the techniques it may use.
	INVESTMENT LIMITATIONS
	THE INVESTMENT ADVISER
	THE PORTFOLIO MANAGERS
	TRUSTEES AND OFFICERS
	(1)The address of each trustee is c/o Blue Chip Investor Fund, 1939 Friendship Drive, Suite C, El Cajon, California 92020.
	BOARD INTEREST IN THE TRUST
	COMPENSATION
	AUDIT COMMITTEE
	ADDITIONAL TAX INFORMATION
	PRICING OF FUND SHARES
	ANTI-MONEY LAUNDERING PROGRAM
	CUSTODIAN
	FUND SERVICES
	INDEPENDENT REGISTERED PUBLIC ACCOUNTING FIRM
	DISCLOSURE OF PORTFOLIO HOLDINGS
	FINANCIAL STATEMENTS
	PROXY VOTING POLICIES
	MORE INFORMATION

